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Global Vision

6 messages

support@globalvisionjobs.com <support@globalvisionjobs.com>
To: topschat@gmail.com

Dear Candidate,
Hope you are doing well!!!!

Please find the payment Break ups-

- Registration - 6962

- Documents Verification - 17582
- Identity Check - 9676

- Online Test - 26550

- Profile Modification - 69620

- Skype Interview - 41536

- Verification - 17582

- Security Deposit -1,20,000

thanks&regards
Global Vision

tapendu chatterjee <topschat@gmail.com>
To: support@globalvisionjobs.com

Hi Support Team,

tapendu chatterjee <topschat@gmail.com>

Thu, Jan 25, 2018 at 1:12 PM

Sun, Jan 28, 2018 at 7:37 PM

This is not a proper money receipt. The amount and purposes are also not correct. Please find the actual breakdown

below -

. Registration - Rs. 6,962

. Documents Verification - Rs. 17,582

. Document Verification Second Time - Rs. 17,582
. Identity Check - Rs. 9,676

. Profile Highlighter - Rs.26,550

. Profile Assessment Test - Rs. 69,620

. Six Sigma Certification Request - Rs. 41,536

. Security Deposit - Rs. 1,20,000
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Total - Rs. 3,09,508

| have not made any payment towards profile modification or Skype interaction.

Please acknowledge and send me the proper money receipt with GST breakdown.

Also let me know the about the refund process and amount.



Thanks
Tapendu Chatterjee
Mobile : +91 9073294297

[Quoted text hidden]

Tapendu Chatterjee

tapendu chatterjee <topschat@gmail.com> Mon, Jan 29, 2018 at 11:06 PM
To: support@globalvisionjobs.com

Hi Support Team,
I've not received any response so far. Please deal this process professionally and respond.

I've also tried to call Aradhya (The HR) and Mr. Avinash (The Relationship Manager) but have not received any response.
The following numbers are switched off.

Mr. Avinash (+91 9818843945 / +91 8527116471)
HR Aradhya (+91 9650572435)

Please let me know about the refund procedure.
Thanks

Tapendu Chatterjee

Mobile : +91 9073294297

[Quoted text hidden]

Tapendu Chatterjee

support@globalvisionjobs.com <support@globalvisionjobs.com> Tue, Jan 30, 2018 at 9:36 AM
To: tapendu chatterjee <topschat@gmail.com>

Dear Candidate,
Hope you are doing well!!!!

Thanks for sharing your concern.This is not the payment receipt its only for the confirmation that for these purposes you
have made the payments.

thanks&regards
Global Vision

tapendu chatterjee <topschat@gmail.com> Wed, Jan 31, 2018 at 10:09 AM
To: Global Vision <vivekglobalvisionjobs@gmail.com>

Hi Vivek and Avinash,
As discussed, please find the mail trail for your reference
Thanks

Tapendu
[Quoted text hidden]

tapendu chatterjee <topschat@gmail.com> Tue, Apr 17, 2018 at 11:57 AM


tel:+91%2090732%2094297

Draft To: support@globalvisionjobs.com

On Thu, Jan 25, 2018 at 1:12 PM, <support@globalvisionjobs.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

Tapendu Chatterjee


mailto:support@globalvisionjobs.com

